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Request 
 
I would like to request the following information. 
 
1. How many accidents were reported on Merseyrail escalators in each of the past 
two years (2017 and 2018)? 
2. How many of these were suffered by children under 10 years?  
3. (If available) how many of these accidents involved shoes/feet being caught in the 
escalators? 
4. If the above information is not held in this form, any other statistics on the 
frequency of recent elevator accidents that you hold.  
5. Reports of internal investigations into escalator safety during the past five years (if 
any). 
6. How were recommendations in such reports (if any) implemented? 
 

 
Response 
 
Thank you for your request, which has been processed by Merseytravel in 
accordance with the Freedom of Information Act. 
 
Unfortunately, Merseytravel does not hold the information you have requested as we 
are not involved in the day to day running of the Merseyrail stations. 
 
I can advise that the information should be held by Merseyrail themselves, however 
as they are a private company they are not subject to the Freedom of Information Act 
and therefore any information they provide to you would be on a voluntary basis. 
 
Merseyrail can be contacted using the details on their website at this link. 
 
I am sorry that we could not be of any further assistance on this occasion. 
 
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to ask for 
an internal review, which should be addressed to:  
 Mrs Julie Watling 
 Legal, Democratic Services & Procurement Manager 
 Merseytravel 
 PO Box 1976 
 Liverpool 
 L69 3HN 
 julie.watling@merseytravel.gov.uk  
 
If you are not content with the result of your internal review, you also have the right 
to complain to the Information Commissioner, whose address is  
 The Information Commissioner’s Office, 
 Wycliffe House, 
 Water Lane, 
 Wilmslow, 
 Cheshire SK9 5AF 
 www.ico.gov.uk  

https://www.merseyrail.org/contact-us.aspx
mailto:julie.watling@merseytravel.gov.uk
http://www.ico.gov.uk/

