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The information supplied continues to be protected by copyright. You are free to use 
it for your own purposes, including for private study and non-commercial research 

and for any other purpose authorised by an exception in current copyright 
law. Documents (except photographs) can also be used in the UK without requiring 

permission for the purposes of news reporting.  Any other reuse, for example, 
commercial publication would require the permission of the copyright holder. 
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Request 1 
 
Would you be kind enough to answer the following questions, please: 
 
1. Is this vessel not the property of the German people?  If not, why not? 
2. Were the German people consulted before she ended up in Liverpool? 
3. Was permission given by the German people that their U-boat could be kept in 
Liverpool? 
4. Was permission of the German people sought and given that their U boat 534 
could be raised from the sea-bed? 
5. Please confirm that the resting place in the sea of so many years since her sinking 
marked a war-grave? 
6. By who's authority was she cut into sections?   
7. Had the German people been consulted and given their permission that Point 6 
should occur? 
8. Did the German Peoples gift U-boat 534 to any person or body? 
9. Have monies of recompense been given to and received by a representative or 
representatives of the German Nation?  If not - Point 10. 
10. Surely any profits derived by persons or bodies from her being turned into a 
money-making tourist attraction are as a result of theft of the vessel from her rightful 
owner or owners? 
11. Have her rightful owners agreed that all profits from her exhibition shall be taken 
by Mersey Travel and its associates? 
12. Have at any time since her discovery the German Peoples been asked if they 
wish their historic vessel and war-grave marker to be returned to the land in which 
she was built? 
 
Under the Freedon of Information Act, I do expect answers to all these question in 
full and hereby thank whomsoever is responsible for replies hereto. 
 

 
Response 1 
 
Thank you for your recent request made under the Freedom of Information Act. 
Please find Merseytravel’s responses to your questions below. 
 

1. Is this vessel not the property of the German people?  If not, why not?  
 

The vessel is legally owned by Merseytravel, who purchased it from the 
former owners, Reedomus ApS, a subsidiary of Karsten Ree Holding ApS 
(KRH). 

 
2. Were the German people consulted before she ended up in Liverpool?  

 
Merseytravel does not hold any recorded information in relation to this 
question. 

 
3. Was permission given by the German people that their U-boat could be kept 

in Liverpool?  
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Merseytravel does not hold any recorded information in relation to this 
question. Permission to locate her in the current position was provided by 
KRH and formed part of the agreement to transfer ownership. 

 
4. Was permission of the German people sought and given that their U boat 534 

could be raised from the sea-bed?  
 

Merseytravel does not hold any recorded information in relation to this 
question. This would be a matter for KRH, who we understand raised her from 
the seabed, to answer. 

 
5. Please confirm that the resting place in the sea of so many years since her 

sinking marked a war-grave?  
 

See point 4 above. 
 

6. By who's authority was she cut into sections?   
 

Permission to split her into three sections was discussed with KRH and 
formed part of the agreement to transfer ownership. 

 
7. Had the German people been consulted and given their permission that Point 

6 should occur?  
 

Merseytravel does not hold any recorded information in relation to this 
question. If any consultation took place it would have been conducted by 
KRH. 

 
8. Did the German Peoples gift U-boat 534 to any person or body?  

 
Merseytravel does not hold any recorded information relating to this question. 

 
9. Have monies of recompense been given to and received by a representative 

or representatives of the German Nation?  If not - Point 10.  
 

Merseytravel does not hold any recorded information in relation to this 
question. 

 
10. Surely any profits derived by persons or bodies from her being turned into a 

money-making tourist attraction are as a result of theft of the vessel from her 
rightful owner or owners? 

 
This is not a valid request under the Act as it is not asking for any recorded 
information. Details of the requirements for a valid request can be found on 
the Information Commissioner’s website at this link. 

 
11. Have her rightful owners agreed that all profits from her exhibition shall be 

taken by Mersey Travel and its associates?  
 

https://ico.org.uk/for-the-public/official-information/
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As stated, Merseytravel are the legal owners of the vessel. We can confirm 
that the transfer of ownership document does allow for a distribution of 
expenses and income associated with the maintenance and operation of U-
534. 

 
12. Have at any time since her discovery the German Peoples been asked if they 

wish their historic vessel and war-grave marker to be returned to the land in 
which she was built?  

 
Merseytravel does not hold any recorded information in relation to this 
question. 

 
I trust that this information is of interest to you. 
 
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right under the 
Act to ask for an internal review, which should be addressed to:  

Mrs Julie Watling 
Legal, Democratic Services & Procurement Manager 
Merseytravel 
PO Box 1976 
Liverpool 
L69 3HN 
julie.watling@merseytravel.gov.uk 

 
If you are not content with the result of your internal review, you also have the right 
to complain to the Information Commissioner, whose address is  

The Information Commissioner’s Office, 
Wycliffe House, 
Water Lane, 
Wilmslow, 
Cheshire SK9 5AF 
www.ico.gov.uk 

 

 
Request 2 
 
I am most grateful to you for your swift response.  Thank you. 
 
Under the same Act and otherwise, I should like to ask the following questions, 
please: 
 

1. Which persons or body holds the Deeds of Purchase or of Gift to the 
alleged ownership of U 534? 
 
2. If this is Merseytravel, then under the Freedon of Information Act, 
presumably such Deed is viewable by members of the public? 
 
3. Would you be good enough to send me a copy of the afore-mentioned 
Deed at your cost? 
 

mailto:julie.watling@merseytravel.gov.uk
http://www.ico.gov.uk/
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4. Has at any time Merseytravel considered or discussed at meetings of its 
Directors or otherwise the situation in which it might find itself in law as to 
actual ownership? 
 
5. With regard to Point 4, has at any time Merseytravel considered or 
discussed at meetings of its Directors or otherwise the situation in which they 
might now be - namely both jointly and severally the possible custodianship of 
stolen property? 
 
6. Can Merseytravel establish actual ownership of U 534? 
 
7. In Germany there is a U-boat viewable by the public which is entire and has 
never been subjected to disgraceful chopping up and through which the public 
can walk for educational viewing purposes. As this vessel had been raised 
and moved in one piece after discovery why was it thought necessary to chop 
up such an historic monument and war-grave as U 534?  
 
8. With regard to Point 7, what advise of such bodies as English Heritage was 
taken by Merseytravel before the canabalizing U 534? 
 
9. Does Merseytravel not consider that it has a moral duty to return U 534 
back to the German peoples or otherwise to agree reparations for its ill-
considered actions? 
 
10. Is not the true reason for the present siting of and in so doing the 
destruction of the integrity of U 534 actually a matter of pure greed and 
financial gain by the body known as Merseytravel? 

 
This is largely a moral question. The points which have riled me (and many others, it 
would seem) having stumbled upon and viewed the most interesting film on the 
raising of U 534 on You Tube, quite out of the blue, is the assumption that a war 
grave and most definitely the property of another nation, regardless of which nation, 
can by raised in such a cavalier fashion with apparently no consultation with the 
familes of the dead or the Government on behalf of the Nation in question. The 
desecration and vandalization of the war-grave known as U 534 is a shame upon our 
Nation and a further a stain thereon for apparently no other purpose than that of 
exploitation in the pursuit of the obtaining of filthy lucre at any cost.  Your comments 
upon this paragraph will be gratefully received. 
 
This is a case of the Elgin Marbles all over again save that in that case it could be 
argued that the mables were conserved rather than destroyed.  In the case of U 534 
it is clearly the opposite - the integrity of U 534 has been destroyed rather than 
conserved. 
 
I am considering the sending of my completed dossier to the German Ambassador to 
the Court of St. James for observations thereupon. 
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Response 2 
 
Thank you for your email, which has been processed as a new request made under 
the Freedom of Information Act. Please find Merseytravel’s responses to your 
questions below. 
 

1. Which persons or body holds the Deeds of Purchase or of Gift to the 
alleged ownership of U 534? 
 
Please find attached a copy of the Agreement for the Purchase and Exhibition 
of U-Boat 534 between Merseytravel and Karsten Ree Holdings ApS & 
Reedomux ApS. This document includes the Title to Vessel. 
 
2. If this is Merseytravel, then under the Freedon of Information Act, 
presumably such Deed is viewable by members of the public? 
 
Please see response to Q1. 
 
3. Would you be good enough to send me a copy of the afore-mentioned 
Deed at your cost? 
 
Please see response to Q1. 
 
4. Has at any time Merseytravel considered or discussed at meetings of its 
Directors or otherwise the situation in which it might find itself in law as to 
actual ownership? 
 
Merseytravel has no recorded information to provide in response to this 
question, other than the attached Agreement confirming our legal ownership 
of the vessel. 
 
5. With regard to Point 4, has at any time Merseytravel considered or 
discussed at meetings of its Directors or otherwise the situation in which they 
might now be - namely both jointly and severally the possible custodianship of 
stolen property? 
 
Please see response to Q4. 
 
6. Can Merseytravel establish actual ownership of U 534? 
 
Please see response to Q1. 
 
7. In Germany there is a U-boat viewable by the public which is entire and has 
never been subjected to disgraceful chopping up and through which the public 
can walk for educational viewing purposes.  As this vessel had been raised 
and moved in one piece after discovery why was it thought necessary to chop 
up such an historic monument and war-grave as U 534?  
 
Merseytravel has no recorded information to provide in response to this 
question. 
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8. With regard to Point 7, what advise of such bodies as English Heritage was 
taken by Merseytravel before the canabalizing U 534? 
 
Merseytravel has no recorded information to provide in response to this 
question. 
 
9. Does Merseytravel not consider that it has a moral duty to return U 534 
back to the German peoples or otherwise to agree reparations for its ill-
considered actions? 
 
This is not a valid request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. 
 
10. Is not the true reason for the present siting of and in so doing the 
destruction of the integrity of U 534 actually a matter of pure greed and 
financial gain by the body known as Merseytravel? 
 
This is not a valid request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. 

 
With regard to your closing paragraphs, your comments are duly noted. A request 
under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 is not, however, the appropriate avenue 
to pursue this argument as you are not asking for recorded information. Customer 
feedback can be submitted to Merseytravel using the contact details on our website. 
 
In relation to the tone and language used in your request, I refer you to the 
Information Commissioner’s guidance on vexatious requests and would advise that if 
this manner of correspondence continues, further enquiries may be refused. 
 
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right under the 
Act to ask for an internal review, which should be addressed to:  

Mrs Julie Watling 
Legal, Democratic Services & Procurement Manager 
Merseytravel 
PO Box 1976 
Liverpool 
L69 3HN 
julie.watling@merseytravel.gov.uk 

 
If you are not content with the result of your internal review, you also have the right 
to complain to the Information Commissioner, whose address is  

The Information Commissioner’s Office, 
Wycliffe House, 
Water Lane, 
Wilmslow, 
Cheshire SK9 5AF 
www.ico.gov.uk 

 

https://www.merseytravel.gov.uk/about-us/Pages/Contact-Us.aspx
https://ico.org.uk/media/for-organisations/documents/1198/dealing-with-vexatious-requests.pdf
mailto:julie.watling@merseytravel.gov.uk
http://www.ico.gov.uk/









































































































































































